


Reading assignment:


The framework of materials and methods 
includes:

• context (Figure 1.1)

• setting

• syllabus

• learners

• language organization of the syllabus 

(Figure 1.2)


Task: 

Examine a teaching environment you are 
familiar with or that you expect to teach in 
the future (for example: English 
kindergarten, business English classes, 
private tutoring, TOEIC prep, EFL, EYL, 
ESP, EAP, CLIL, etc.).



List the characteristics of your learners 
and of the teaching situation.  

Then decide which of these 
characteristics are more significant. 

For example, how are your classroom 
materials selected? What is the goal? 

To whom are you responsible?


What type of language organization would 
you choose for the syllabus? 

For example, you may choose a 
situational type of syllabus for learners 
that are expecting to use English while 
they travel. 

Finally, what kind of materials would be 
most suitable for these learners and this 
context?



Materials are “anything which can be 
used to facilitate the learning of a 
language, including coursebooks, 
videos, graded readers, flash cards, 
games, websites and mobile phone 
interactions” 



Materials development is…


• production

• evaluation

• adaptation 

• use of materials



It is also a field of academic study 
investigating… 

• the principles of design 

• procedures of the design

• writing

• implementation

• evaluation 

• analysis



Setting the scene


• English as a Foreign Language (EFL) 

• English as a Second Language (ESL) 

• English for Young Learners (EYL)

• English for Specific Purposes (ESP)



Setting the scene


• English as a Foreign Language (EFL) 


• English as a Second Language (ESL) 


• English for Young Learners (EYL)


• English for Specific Purposes (ESP)


• English for Academic Purposes (EAP)


• Content and Language Integrated 
Learning (CLIL)



What educational contexts are you familiar with?

Lessons ->



Contexts



Learners



Learners

• Age

• Interests

• Proficiency level

• Aptitude (abilities)

• L1

• Academic level

• Attitudes

• Motivation

• Reasons for learning

• Learning styles

• Personality



Syllabus





Syllabus

4 language skills



Materials framework in action

Where Who Why What

High school High school 
Ss Good grades Test prep

+ EAP

Adult 
academy

Casual 
learners

General 
English

Practical + 
situational

Corporation Business Ss Work Formal 
English
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